
Kent’s Got Talent Notes to Leaders 
 
Girlguiding Kent East, West and Weald Counties are organising a competition this 
year – Kent’s Got Talent (KGT). This event is being organised and hosted by 
Girlguiding Kent East Choir, with the permission and support of the County 
Commissioners. 
 
What’s a talent? Anything that could be performed on a stage! Dancing, singing, 
instrumental playing, comedy, acting – pretty much anything goes! 
 
What do we need from you? Encourage your girls to take part! They could be 
filmed at home playing piano, or dancing a ballet solo OR you could build this into 
your Term 5 planning! Girls can enter alone or in a group – why not consider a 
team effort within your unit – you could even hold your own competition between 
your sixes or patrols! Once you have got filmed recordings of the girls’ entries, 
please complete the application form and you will be sent a link to a secure drive 
to upload your media. The parent information notes includes a permission form 
which you should collect and retain (we don’t need them) regarding the sharing of 
media. Recordings must be uploaded by 31st May. 
 
What next? The videos will be reviewed by the local team who will select 3 finalists 
to go forward to the live final at The Howard School in Rainham on 4th October 
2025. Finalists will be announced by 30th June. 
 
Finalists will need to attend one Choir rehearsal in Canterbury – these are: 12th July, 
27th Sept to have a rehearsal of their performance and learn the finale song(s). 
Rehearsals take place in the afternoon; exact call times will be agreed nearer the 
time. They can attend with or without leaders. 
 
Finalists can attend the final with or without leaders. 
 
The fine details of the final are being worked on behind the scenes and more info 
will be available in due course. 
 
Your local contact is: 
Julia Foxon who can be contacted by e-mail: 
kgtgirlguidingkenteast@gmail.com 
 
 
If you would like to volunteer at the event, we would love to hear from you! 
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